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Howdy Folks,  
 
Thanks to you, we are now reaching 55 countries with this newsletter. We didn’t 
spend any money on advertising so it must be because you have sent our newsletter 
to your friends in other countries and they have signed up. We appreciate you doing 
that!  
 
Those of you who have attended classes heard me talk about my friend Dr. Terry 
Sumpter who attended class with me about 3 1/2 years ago. Since then he has 
preformed about 5000 surgeries and not given a drop of blood to any patient. To our 
knowledge, this has never been done before. Terry is one of those fellows who took 
the information from the class and ran with it. His patients not only do not lose blood, 
they heal faster. Think of the benefits this would bring if there were one doctor with 
this ability in every hospital in the country. 
 
Terry had written a research paper on his work and since I don’t understand medical 
terms, has asked him to tell you about his work. Hopefully we will soon have a video 
of him on You Tube but for now----here’s Terry. 
 
Enjoy the holidays, 
 
Raymon 

  

Thank you very much Raymon for the kind words and introduction. What has been 
happening in my life as a doctor of anesthesia is research, research, and more 
research. I am finishing another doctorate in clinical anesthesia from Union 
University in Jackson, Tennessee and doing a dissertation project as my capstone 
involving a unique topic. 
 
As a practicing anesthesia provider for 33 years something has occurred time and 
time again throughout my career and that is fear of anesthesia, or “the fear of going to 
sleep” as some patients call it. Thousands of my anesthetic cases have been done over 
the years and this conversation always rises to the surface in the preoperative area. 
One topic of conversation always prevalent in the operating room suite is the 
patient’s distinct fear of anesthesia manifested by apprehension and nervousness. 
When asked of the patient as to the “why” this often cannot be expressed in words.  
 
The fear concept prior to being anesthetized seems to be an elusive topic of 
discussion that patients cannot verbalize. To make matters worse there is no 
concrete medical evidenced-based practice literature that has been written on the 
subject. Intriguing as this topic is, I began to delve into it as a research project that 
has never been done before and only superficially written about! 
 
Little did I know the intense process I would have to go through to get this research 
project off the ground? First, the university would have to sanction this project. I had 
to go through what is known as an “Institutional Review Board” (IRB) for short! The 
entire project would have to be put on display in front of professors after professors 
asking me to document everything I was going to do and what and how I was going to 
do it! This process took me 4 months to complete before I could initiate anything, and 
finally I was given the blessing by the IRB board to complete this research project. 
This capstone research project has been given an official identity number through 
the IRB board and has been sanctioned full authority by the university. This capstone 
project is indeed real, authentic, and will be published worldwide when finished. I am 
very excited about this project, as is Raymon, and we all look forward to sharin! g it 
with you. 
 
At this juncture of time I have 100 patient cases that were given a survey 
questionnaire obtaining 30 specific questions prior to being anesthetized. The 
answers are now being correlated to understand the “why” in the fear factor. Being a 
dowser I had to involve Raymon. What we came up with is the possibility that the fear 
of anesthesia was more than just a case of the nerves. The linkage may be more 
complex than that! 
 
This project has become more than an academic endeavor and is raising some 
shocking data when dowsing is introduced into the research. To give you some 
dowsing statistics on this project 38% of the total case studied population has 
FRAGMENTED SOULS. (Raymon’s DVD “A Healthy Mind and Body” contains more 
information about Fragmented Souls and how to correct this situation.) Does this 
have your attention? I really didn’t know what I was dealing with in the patient 
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population until I discovered this. How can modern medicine heal anybody or do 
more than mask the truth through more pills when these conditions exist? 
 
I could tell you more but we need to wait until all this data can be sorted out. Raymon 
and I are on the cutting edge of defining what it is that makes patients fear 
anesthesia. More paramount is whenever dowsing is introduced there will be a 
distinct possibility of healing those who are indeed in trouble. This is just the 
beginning and there is more information to come when I have all the data back from 
the statistician. 
 
The dowsing community has something to look forward to in the year of 2012. We all 
are beginning to understand things we never knew existed in a brand new way. This 
newsletter will keep you posted as the project progresses. 

Have a blessed Holiday Season and HAPPY NEW YEAR. 
 
Dr. Terry 
 
 
As a holiday offering, we have the Foundation DVD "On the Road with Raymon" on 
special for the month of December at $15 (normally $25). It is a great introduction to 
Dowsing and things it can be used for and will make a great Christmas gift for those 
ready to take control of their lifes. This is only available for order in this newsletter, 
you will not find it on the website at this special price. 

 
And on another note from Raymon, here is a recent happening: 

Not long ago my friends and I went to a gun show in Tennessee. Seems like lot more 
people attend gun shows now than before the last national election and this one was 
well attended, mostly by people driving pickup trucks. Seems the gun show recently 
had drawn about ten thousand people. 
 
 
We stood in line outside for half an hour before getting inside the building. Many of 
the crowd were bearded men wearing camouflage clothing, while some were neatly 
groomed and dressed and some women were in attendance. 
 
Not once did I hear anyone complain about having to stand in line in the cold, 
however, strangers were speaking and friendly, some asking me if the gun I was 
wearing was for sale. 
 
Inside were tables in rows with the gun dealers and vendors behind the tables, with 
about 8 feet of space between the rows of tables. Most everyone there was carrying at 
least one gun of some type. My three friends had at least six among us. Without 
anyone to give orders, the group formed two lines, one line going in one direction and 
the other line going in the opposite direction between the rows of tables. This 
allowed free movement and moving around anyone who wished to stop and look or 
talk to the vendors. 
 
People bumped into each other from time to time but each time anyone bumped into 
me, they said, “Excuse me’’ or words to that effect. I never heard a cross word from 
anyone. 
 
Now thinking back, this seems quite a contrast to something in the paper 3 years ago 
that happened in New York. Seems that Wal-Mart was having an early morning sale 
and as an employee opened the door, the crowd charged him, damaging the door and 
trampling him to death then walking over other employees who came to rescue him. 
 
Also, on Black Friday this year there were riots at Wal-Mart and other stores across 
the nation. If you doubt this, just Google ‘Black Friday Wal-Mart riots’ and watch. If 
you think we live in a civilized nation, the videos will likely change your mind. 
 
This ‘gun free zone’ stuff is a bad joke. The massacre at Va. Tech and other schools is 
an example of how it doesn’t work. The last place on earth that a dangerous person 
wants to start trouble is at a place like this gun show where most everyone is armed. 
 
Got to thinking about it, these Tennessee hillbillies have a lot more going for them 
than most people realize. I’ll take my chances with this type of people any day.  
Raymon 

And now it is time for the Call to Action. 
Please join us December 22nd. For full details visit 
www.raymongraceprojects.com/calltoaction.htm  

 

We appreciate you! 
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